

Notice: These minutes are paraphrased and reflect the proceedings of the Board of Commissioners. MCA 7-4-2611(2) (b).

\*\*\*\*\*

## MONDAY, MAY 27, 2013

The Board of County Commissioners met in continued session at 8:00 o'clock A.M. Chairman Holmquist, Commissioner Scott and Krueger, and Clerk Robinson were present.

### COUNTY OFFICES CLOSED - MEMORIAL DAY

At 5:00 o'clock P.M., the Board continued the session until 8:00 o'clock A.M. on May 28, 2013.

\*\*\*\*\*

## TUESDAY, MAY 28, 2013

The Board of County Commissioners met in continued session at 8:00 o'clock A.M. Chairman Holmquist, Commissioner Scott and Krueger, and Clerk Robinson were present.

**12:00 p.m. Commissioner Scott: FVDC meeting @ Three Rivers Bank**  
**3:00 p.m. Commissioner Krueger: Refuse Board meeting @ Solid Waste District Office**

At 5:00 o'clock P.M., the Board continued the session until 8:00 o'clock A.M. on May 29, 2013.

\*\*\*\*\*

## WEDNESDAY, MAY 29, 2013

[Audiofile](#)

The Board of County Commissioners met in continued session at 8:00 o'clock A.M. Chairman Holmquist, Commissioner Scott and Krueger, and Clerk Robinson were present.

**Chairman Holmquist opened public comment on matters within the Commissions' Jurisdiction, no one present to speak, Chairman Holmquist closed the public comment period.**

Chairman Holmquist led the Pledge of Allegiance.

### **MEETING W/ B. J. GRIEVE, PLANNING & ZONING OFFICE RE: SB 324/ REQUIREMENTS FOR REVIEW OF BUILDINGS FOR RENT OR LEASE**

#### **8:45:40 AM**

Present: Chairman Pamela J. Holmquist, Commissioner Gary D. Krueger, Assistant Mike Pence, Planning & Zoning Director B. J. Grieve, Clerk Kile

Grieve met with the commission and summarized Senate Bill 324 (Requirements for Review of Buildings for Lease or Rent Regulations) that become effective September 1, 2013. The commission unanimously agreed to work towards adopting the regulations before September 1, 2013.

### **DOCUMENT FOR SIGNATURE: REQUEST FOR GROUP LIFE INSURANCE AMENDMENT**

#### **9:07:28 AM**

Present: Chairman Pamela J. Holmquist, Commissioner Gary D. Krueger, Assistant Mike Pence, H. R. Director Tammy Skramovsky, Clerk Kile

Skramovsky explained the group life insurance amendment is a clarification of the summary plan.

Commissioner Krueger made a **motion** to approve for signature group life insurance amendment. Chairman Holmquist **seconded** the motion. **Aye** - Holmquist and Krueger. Motion carried by quorum.

### **DOCUMENT FOR SIGNATURE: FLEXIBLE BENEFITS PLAN AMENDMENT**

#### **9:08:29 AM**

Present: Chairman Pamela J. Holmquist, Commissioner Gary D. Krueger, Assistant Mike Pence, H. R. Director Tammy Skramovsky, Clerk Kile

Commissioner Krueger made a **motion** to approve for signature the flexible benefits plan amendment. Chairman Holmquist **seconded** the motion. **Aye** - Holmquist and Krueger. Motion carried by quorum.

### **CONSIDERATION OF H.R. TRANSMITTAL: POSITION SPLIT/ LPN CASE MANAGER**

#### **9:10:09 AM**

Present: Chairman Pamela J. Holmquist, Commissioner Gary D. Krueger, Assistant Mike Pence, H. R. Director Tammy Skramovsky, Clerk Kile

Commissioner Krueger made a **motion** to approve the position split for an LPN Case Manager. Chairman Holmquist **seconded** the motion. **Aye** - Holmquist and Krueger. Motion carried by quorum.

**WEDNESDAY, MAY 29, 2013**  
**(Continued)**

**DOCUMENT FOR SIGNATURE: DPHHS CONTRACT #14-07-5-01-015-0**

**9:11:17 AM**

Present: Chairman Pamela J. Holmquist, Commissioner Gary D. Krueger, Assistant Mike Pence, Clerk Kile

Commissioner Krueger made a **motion** to approve DPHHS Contract #14-07-5-01-015-0. Chairman Holmquist **seconded** the motion. **Aye** - Holmquist and Krueger. Motion carried by quorum.

**OPEN BIDS: CHEMICALS/ WEED DEPT.**

**9:18:17 AM**

Present: Chairman Pamela Holmquist, Commissioner Gary D. Krueger, Assistant Mike Pence, Weed/Parks/Maintenance Director Jed Fisher, Weed & Parks Department Gordy Jewett, Clerk Kile

Bids received with bid bonds/ cashier's checks enclosed from:

<b>Red River Specialties</b>	Tordon	Gallon	\$ 47.63
	Transline	Gallon	\$ 143.03
	2,4-D	Gallon	\$ 12.97
	Opensight	lb.	\$ 80.34
	Lontrel	Gallon	No Bid
	Banvel	Gallon	\$ 54.12
	Perspective	Gallon	\$ 73.60
	Milestone	Gallon	\$ 299.73
<b>Alligare</b>	Tordon	Gallon	\$ 41.45
	Transline	Gallon	\$ 118.05
	2,4-D	Gallon	\$ 15.45
	Opensight	lb.	No Bid
	Lontrel	Gallon	No Bid
	Banvel	Gallon	\$ 48.00
	Perspective	Gallon	No Bid
	Milestone	Gallon	No Bid
<b>CHS</b>	Tordon	Gallon	\$ 50.34
	Transline	Gallon	\$ 142.10
	2,4-D	Gallon	\$ 14.25
	Opensight	lb.	\$ 81.55
	Lontrel	Gallon	\$ 144.13
	Banvel	Gallon	\$ 59.16
	Perspective	Gallon	\$ 74.71
	Milestone	Gallon	\$ 304.23
<b>CPS Timberland</b>	Tordon	Gallon	\$ 41.05
	Transline	Gallon	\$ 116.00
	2,4-D	Gallon	\$ 12.70
	Opensight	lb.	\$ 80.34
	Lontrel	Gallon	No Bid
	Banvel	Gallon	\$ 41.95
	Perspective	Gallon	\$ 73.60
	Milestone	Gallon	\$ 299.73

Commissioner Krueger made a **motion** to take the bids under consideration. Chairman Holmquist **seconded** the motion. **Aye** - Holmquist and Krueger. Motion carried by quorum.

**DOCUMENT FOR SIGNATURE: CONSTRUCTION CONTRACT/ RSID #154 (LITTLE MOUNTAIN PROPERTIES)**

**9:25:09 AM**

Present: Chairman Pamela J. Holmquist, Commissioner Gary D. Krueger, Assistant Mike Pence, Public Works Director Dave Prunty, Clerk Kile

Commissioner Krueger made a **motion** to approve for signature construction contract for RSID #154/ Little Mountain Properties. Chairman Holmquist **seconded** the motion. **Aye** - Holmquist and Krueger. Motion carried by quorum.

**CONSIDERATION OF LAKESHORE PERMIT: WATERSIDE CONDOMINIUM OWNERS ASSOC., FLP 13-32**

**9:15:38 AM**

Present: Chairman Pamela J. Holmquist, Commissioner Gary D. Krueger, Assistant Mike Pence, Planner Bailey Minnich, Planner Eric Mack, Clerk Kile

Mack reported Waterside Condominium Owners Association Inc. requested an after the fact permit to remove accumulated silt from around an existing seawall at 7175 Highway 93 South on Flathead Lake.

Commissioner Krueger made a **motion** to approve the Lakeshore Permit for Waterside Condominium Owners Association Inc. / FLP 13-32. Chairman Holmquist **seconded** the motion. **Aye** - Holmquist and Krueger. Motion carried by quorum.

**WEDNESDAY, MAY 29, 2013**  
**(Continued)**

**CONSIDERATION OF LAKESHORE PERMIT EXTENSION: MONTANA EAGLE DEVELOPMENT, FLP 11-17**

**9:16:59 AM**

Present: Chairman Pamela J. Holmquist, Commissioner Gary D. Krueger, Assistant Mike Pence, Planner Bailey Minnich, Planner Eric Mack, Clerk Kile

Minnich reported the original permit was issued May 25, 2011 to install a pump out station in association with the marina and was set to expire on May 25, 2012. On April 25, 2012, a one-year extension was approved and the applicant is requesting an additional extension.

Commissioner Krueger made a **motion** to approve Lakeshore Permit Extension FLP 11-17. Chairman Holmquist **seconded** the motion. **Aye** - Holmquist and Krueger. Motion carried by quorum.

**CONSIDERATION OF ADOPTION OF RESOLUTION: CANCEL OUTSTANDING CHECKS/WARRANTS, FINANCE**

**9:17:21 AM**

Present: Chairman Pamela J. Holmquist, Commissioner Gary D. Krueger, Assistant Mike Pence, Finance Director Sandy Carlson, Finance Technician Tamara Helmstetler, Clerk Kile

Commissioner Krueger made a **motion** to approve Resolution 2356. Chairman Holmquist **seconded** the motion. **Aye** - Holmquist and Krueger. Motion carried by quorum.

RESOLUTION NO. 2356  
ORDER CANCELLING COUNTY WARRANTS

WHEREAS, the Board of Commissioners of Flathead County, Montana, has been made aware that the County warrants listed on Exhibit "A" hereto meet the requirements of abandonment identified in MCA 70-9-803; and

WHEREAS, warrants over eight (8) years old may not be collected by the payees thereof. (Section 27-2-2-2, MCD Volume 21, Opinions of the Attorney General, No. 1).

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED AND ORDERED that the Flathead County warrants listed on Exhibit "A" hereto, should be and they hereby are cancelled.

DATED this 29<sup>th</sup> day of May, 2013.

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS  
Flathead County, Montana

By/s/Pamela J. Holmquist  
Pamela J. Holmquist, Chairman

By/s/Calvin L. Scott  
Calvin L. Scott, Member

ATTEST:  
Paula Robinson, Clerk

By/s/Gary D. Krueger  
Gary D. Krueger, Member

By/s/Diana Kile  
Diana Kile, Deputy

Section II:

Column 1 NAUPA Property type code	Column 2 Date of last Transaction/d ate payable	Column 3 Amount due to the owner	column 4 Owner's social security number or federal identification number	Column 5 Owner's name: list alphabetically by last name, first name, middle initial	Column 6 Last known mailing address: street, city, state, zip code
MS01	04/27/2012	\$ 25.00		BARNES, SHIRLEY	PO Box 1334 Columbia Falls, MT
MS01	04/27/2012	\$ 25.00		FRASER, MICHAEL	300 Three Mile Dr Kalispell, MT
MS01	05/25/2012	\$ 25.00		HURLEY, MARY	610 Tetrault Rd Kalispell, MT
CK06	1/9/2009	\$ 115.69	unknown	ARMOR HOLDINGS FOF	13386 International Parkway Jacksonville, FL 32218-2383
CK06	9/19/2008	\$ 1.80	unknown	CHALINDER, BEA	330 3rd Ave W Apt 213 Kalispell, MT 59901
CK06	6/5/2009	\$ 24.10	unknown	DEMOS, DALE	4840 Foothill Rd Bigfork, MT 59911
CK06	5/29/2009	\$ 6.05	unknown	DROPPS, JUSTIN	124 Empire Loop Kalispell, MT 59901
CK06	7/11/2008	\$ 15.15	unknown	DUNLAP, TOM	553 Willow Glen Dr Kalispell, MT 59901
CK06	11/6/2008	\$ 15.15	unknown	DUNLAP, TOM	553 Willow Glen Dr Kalispell, MT 59901
CK06	12/12/2008	\$ 130.50	unknown	DUROS, LAURA LEE	170 Dawn Dr Columbia Falls, MT 59912
CK06	4/17/2009	\$ 13.10	unknown	ELLIOTT, DEREK	114 Boise Ave Kalispell, MT 59901
CK06	10/31/2008	\$ 20.78	unknown	FERRIL, WILLIAM	PO Box 324 Whitefish, MT 59937
CK06	7/11/2008	\$ 436.74	unknown	FISHER, JAY F & DORIS	PO Box 4069 Whitefish, MT 59937
CK06	4/21/2008	\$ 300.00	unknown	FISHER, SUSIE	601 Sunset Blvd Conrad, MT 59425
CK06	12/19/2008	\$ 2.34	unknown	FRASER, MICHAEL W.	385 Eastview Dr Kalispell, MT 59901
CK06	12/12/2008	\$ 23.70	unknown	FREEMAN, MARLENE	175 Springdale Dr Kalispell, MT 59901
CK06	1/20/2012	\$ 182.00	unknown	GONZALEZ, ANDRES	900 Wisconsin Ave Whitefish, MT 59937
CK06	12/19/2008	\$ 3.00	unknown	HANSON, KYLE AND CA	110 Green Briar Dr Kalispell, MT 59901
CK06	12/7/2012	\$ 27.50	unknown	KENDRICK, DONNA	3224 Hwy 2 West Kalispell, MT 59901
CK06	2/6/2009	\$ 40.00	unknown	MARTIN, MICHAEL	1491 Lower Valley Rd Kalispell, MT 59901
CK06	12/19/2008	\$ 3.00	unknown	MCDONALD, GORDON	PO Box 248 Somers, MT 59932-0248
CK06	4/10/2009	\$ 8.00	unknown	MICHELS, EVAN	334 Harrison Blvd #3 Kalispell, MT 59901
CK06	1/30/2009	\$ 13.10	unknown	MORIN, BRITAIN JAMES	444 4th St E Kalispell, MT 59901
CK06	12/26/2008	\$ 8.19	unknown	OWENS, PAMELA J.	PO Box 11073 Kalispell, MT 59904
CK06	6/19/2009	\$ 5.00	unknown	STRATFORD VILLAGE	PO Box 3232 Kalispell, MT 59901
CK06	9/12/2008	\$ 15.00	unknown	STURTZ, TERI	PO Box 196 Karnack, TX 75661
CK06	12/31/2008	\$ 25.00	unknown	WINNE, TAMMY	PO Box 190767 Hungry Horse, MT 59919
CK06	10/31/2008	\$ 18.60	unknown	WITTRICK, RON	235 10th St West Kalispell, MT 59901
AMOUNT REMITTED		\$ 1,528.49			

**WEDNESDAY, MAY 29, 2013**  
**(Continued)**

**MONTHLY MEETING W/ DAVE PRUNTY, SOLID WASTE DISTRICT**

**9:30:26 AM**

Present: Chairman Pamela J. Holmquist, Commissioner Gary D. Krueger, Assistant Mike Pence, Public Works Director Dave Prunty, Solid Waste Operations Manager Jim Chilton, Kera Schlegel, Kim Schlegel, Clerk Kile

Prunty met with the commission and reported award of the construction of the Olney container site was awarded to LaSalle Sand & Gravel. In other business, he spoke about the effectiveness of their ground water corrective action; reviewed landfill expansion progression; spoke about the highway litter program; spoke about preparing a policy statement regarding container site rules and regulations. Lengthy discussion was held regarding recycling and the cost effectiveness of recycling.

**PUBLIC HEARING: TAX INCENTIVE REQUEST/ EMOND**

**10:01:25 AM**

Present: Chairman Pamela J. Holmquist, Commissioner Gary D. Krueger, Assistant Mike Pence, Deputy County Attorney Tara Fugina, Clerk Kile

Fugina noted the tax incentive request is for remodel of an existing building and came to us from the City of Columbia Falls who pre-approved the request.

**Chairman Holmquist opened the public hearing to anyone wishing to speak in regards to the tax incentive request by Emond.**

**No one rising to speak, Chairman Holmquist closed the public hearing.**

Commissioner Krueger made a **motion** to approve for signature Resolution 2357. Chairman Holmquist **seconded** the motion. **Aye** - Holmquist and Krueger. Motion carried by quorum.

RESOLUTION NO. 2357

WHEREAS, the Board of Commissioners of Flathead County, Montana, passed Resolution No. 475 on April 8, 1983, and Resolution No. 475A on February 21, 1984, allowing tax benefits for remodeling, reconstruction or expansion of existing structures in Flathead County;

WHEREAS, Pierre and Camilla Emond of Columbia Falls, Montana, have applied for the tax benefits for remodeling the building located at 140 Nucleus Ave, Columbia Falls, Montana, Lots 13, 14 and 15, Block 5 of Columbia Falls Townsite, Flathead County, Montana;

WHEREAS, the Board of Commissioners of Flathead County, Montana, held a public hearing under the provisions of section 15-24-1501, M.C.A., on the 6<sup>th</sup> day of May, 2013, concerning the request for tax benefits filed by Pierre and Camilla Emond; and

WHEREAS, the Board of Commissioners of Flathead County, Montana, having reviewed the application of Pierre and Camilla Emond and the testimony presented at the public hearing, has concluded that the application for tax reduction benefits meets the requirements of the applicable statutes and resolutions.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the remodeling of the existing building located at 140 Nucleus Ave, Columbia Falls, Montana, shall be granted the tax benefits set forth in Resolution Nos. 476 and 476A and Section 15-24-1501, M.C.A.

DATED this 29<sup>th</sup> day of May, 2013.

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS  
Flathead County, Montana

By/s/Pamela J. Holmquist  
Pamela J. Holmquist, Chairman

By/s/Absent  
Calvin L. Scott, Member

ATTEST:  
Paula Robinson, Clerk

By/s/Gary D. Krueger  
Gary D. Krueger, Member

By/s/Diana Kile  
Diana Kile, Deputy

**PUBLIC HEARING: TAX INCENTIVE REQUEST/ RUPP**

**10:15:32 AM**

Present: Chairman Pamela J. Holmquist, Commissioner Gary D. Krueger, Assistant Mike Pence, Deputy County Attorney Tara Fugina, Clerk Kile

Fugina noted the tax incentive request is for remodel of an existing building and came to us from the City of Columbia Falls who pre-approved the request.

**Chairman Holmquist opened the public hearing to anyone wishing to speak in regards to the tax incentive request by Rupp.**

**No one rising to speak, Chairman Holmquist closed the public hearing.**

Commissioner Krueger made a **motion** to approve for signature Resolution 2358. Chairman Holmquist **seconded** the motion. **Aye** - Holmquist and Krueger. Motion carried by quorum.

**WEDNESDAY, MAY 29, 2013  
(Continued)**

RESOLUTION NO. 2358

WHEREAS, the Board of Commissioners of Flathead County, Montana, passed Resolution No. 475 on April 8, 1983, and Resolution No. 475A on February 21, 1984, allowing tax benefits for remodeling, reconstruction or expansion of existing structures in Flathead County;

WHEREAS, Robert R. and Gerri R. Rupp of Columbia Falls, Montana, have applied for the tax benefits for remodeling the building from a duplex to a preschool, located at 1388 4<sup>th</sup> Avenue WN, Columbia Falls, Montana, in Lots 8, 9 and 10, Block 4 of Columbia Falls Townsite, Flathead County, Montana;

WHEREAS, the Board of Commissioners of Flathead County, Montana, held a public hearing under the provisions of section 15-24-1501, M.C.A., on the 6<sup>th</sup> day of May, 2013, concerning the request for tax benefits filed by Robert R. and Gerri R. Rupp; and

WHEREAS, the Board of Commissioners of Flathead County, Montana, having reviewed the application of Robert R. and Gerri R. Rupp and the testimony presented at the public hearing, has concluded that the application for tax reduction benefits meets the requirements of the applicable statutes and resolutions.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the remodeling of the existing building from a duplex to a preschool, located at 1388 4<sup>th</sup> Avenue WN, Columbia Falls, Montana, shall be granted the tax benefits set forth in Resolution Nos. 476 and 476A and Section 15-24-1501, M.C.A.

DATED this 29<sup>th</sup> day of May, 2013.

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS  
Flathead County, Montana

By/s/Pamela J. Holmquist  
Pamela J. Holmquist, Chairman

By/s/Absent  
Calvin L. Scott, Member

By/s/Gary D. Krueger  
Gary D. Krueger, Member

ATTEST:  
Paula Robinson, Clerk

By/s/Diana Kile  
Diana Kile, Deputy

**MEETING W/ KELLY DANIELSON, MWED RE: UPDATE ON FCEDA**

**10:30:36 AM**

Present: Chairman Pamela J. Holmquist, Commissioner Gary D. Krueger, Assistant Mike Pence, Kellie Danielson, Rick Blake, Paul Johanssen, Clerk Kile

Kellie Danielson, President of Montana West Economic Development met with the commission and reviewed programs they offer and administer to promote economic job growth. In other business, she reported on the rail park in Evergreen under development and spoke about transferring ownership of Gateway West Mall.

**11:00 a.m. County Attorney meeting @ Co. Atty's Office**

At 5:00 o'clock P.M., the Board continued the session until 8:00 o'clock A.M. on May 30, 2013.

\*\*\*\*\*

**THURSDAY, MAY 30, 2013**

**Audiofile**

The Board of County Commissioners met in continued session at 8:00 o'clock A.M. Chairman Holmquist, Commissioner Scott and Krueger, and Clerk Robinson were present.

Chairman Holmquist led the Pledge of Allegiance.

**COMMISSIONERS' BUDGET WORKSHOP**

**1:00:00 PM**

Present: Chairman Pamela J. Holmquist, Commissioner Calvin L. Scott, Commissioner Gary D. Krueger, Assistant Mike Pence, Finance Director Sandy Carlson, Finance Technicians Amy Dexter & Tamara Helmstetler, Clerk DeReu

General discussion was held relative to sidebars requests by various departments and the overall budget for FY13-14.

**4:00 p.m. BLUAC meeting @ Bethany Lutheran**

At 5:00 o'clock P.M., the Board continued the session until 8:00 o'clock A.M. on May 31, 2013.

\*\*\*\*\*

\*\*\*\*\*

**FRIDAY, MAY 31, 2013**

The Board of County Commissioners met in continued session at 8:00 o'clock A.M. Chairman Holmquist, Commissioner Scott and Krueger, and Clerk Robinson were present.

**NO MEETINGS SCHEDULED**

At 5:00 o'clock P.M., the Board continued the session until 8:00 o'clock A.M. on June 3, 2013.

\*\*\*\*\*

**Following are claims for the month of May, 2013.**

Vendor Name	Amount
168TICKETS LLC	\$1,600.00
2M COMPANY INC	\$480.00
3-V DISTRIBUTING	\$22,554.00
4BBBB INVESTMENTS LLC	\$1,868.19
5 STAR BTG	\$395.00
A & I DISTRIBUTORS	\$5,850.88
A PLUS HEALTH CARE	\$880.00
A-1 VACUUM & JANITORIAL SUPPLYS,INC	\$120.75
ACME CHEMICAL TOILET RENTALS	\$60.00
ACTION AUTO GLASS	\$100.00
ADVANCED RESTAURANT SUPPLY INC	\$300.00
AEROTECH LABORATORIES INC	\$36.72
AGAPE' HOME CARE INC	\$9,738.49
ALBRIGHT, HERB	\$28.80
ALLEGIANCE BENEFIT PLAN MANAGEMENT	\$831.25
ALPINE BUSINESS CENTER	\$4,360.00
AMSAN CUSTODIAL SUPPLY	\$824.74
AMUNDSON, CHERYL	\$500.00
ANDERSON'S MASONRY HEARTH & HOME	\$69.53
ANTUNA, BUD	\$76.80
APCO INTERNATIONAL, INC	\$200.00
APEC	\$1,000.00
APPEL, CYRIL	\$10.80
APPLIED INDUSTRIAL TECHNOLOGIES INC	\$1,648.86
ARCHITECTS DESIGN GROUP PC	\$4,400.00
ARGABRIGHT, ANDREW	\$69.20
ARMY - NAVY	\$57.17
ARNDT, DEE	\$25.00
ARNDT, ELIZABETH C	\$34.17
ASPHALT DRUM MIXERS INC	\$2,776.30
AT&T MOBILITY	\$1,988.88
ATCFII MONTANA LLC	\$2,301.97
ATKINSON, FRANCIS JOHN	\$66.38
AURORA BANK	\$7.00
AUTO ELECTRIC REBUILDERS INC	\$250.00
BAILEY, ERICK	\$29.00
BANK OF AMERICA -	\$43,913.73
BATTERY SYSTEMS	\$175.08
BAXTER, JOHN M	\$25.00
BEAUCLAIR-GRAY, LYNETTE M	\$196.50
BEAUDETTE CONSULTING ENGINEERS INC	\$603.75
BEE BROADCASTING INC	\$600.00
BEHE, CONNIE	\$76.00
BELSON OUTDOORS	\$3,586.08
BENNETT, MARILYN J	\$64.00
BERTOLINI VALVES INC	\$225.33
BID INC	\$100.00
BIG JOHN'S	\$224.27
BIGFORK SENIOR CITIZENS	\$300.00
BIGFORK WATER/SEWER DISTRICT	\$126.35
BINETTE, ANDREW	\$20.55
BLACKOPS TECHNOLOGIES LLC	\$1,105.00
BLAIR, BRANDI J	\$14.83
BLUE COW ENTERPRISES INC	\$16.00
BOB BARKER CO INC	\$928.22
BOGNER, JOSEPH A	\$41.52
BOLSTAD, PHIL	\$186.06
BOLSTER'S TOWING INC	\$245.00
BRESNAN COMMUNICATIONS LLC	\$2,050.42

**May, 2013**  
**(Continued)**

BRIDGER FINANCIAL SERVICES	\$1,570.96
BRILES, RICHARD W MD	\$3,000.00
BRUCO INC	\$70.50
BUCK, TIMOTHY	\$70.00
BUFFALO HILL FUNERAL HOME	\$4,400.00
BULL, PEGGY S	\$37.43
BULLITT COMMUNICATIONS	\$18,802.35
BURKHART DENTAL SUPPLY	\$206.58
BURTON, JAMES H	\$945.00
BUTTEL, STEVE	\$71.40
CAMPBELL, MARILYN Y	\$40.00
CAPITAL ONE COMMERCIAL	\$1,207.15
CAPSER, NICOLE M	\$39.82
CARDINAL DISCOUNT SUPPLY INC	\$316.44
CARDINAL HEALTH	\$321.15
CARQUEST	\$23.50
CASSIDY, KATE	\$58.00
CBM FOOD SERVICE	\$20,178.79
CDW GOVERNMENT INC	\$151,646.10
CENTRAL FIBER CORPORATION	\$17,130.00
CENTURYLINK	\$19,250.39
CHERY, RACHEL	\$102.50
CHICK, BULA	\$500.00
CHILTON, JIM	\$72.00
CHS INC - KALISPELL	\$1,415.09
CITYSERVICEVALCON LLC	\$81,864.95
CLEGG, ANDREW	\$69.00
CLINICAL PHARMACY, THE	\$2,361.95
COCA-COLA BOTTLING	\$207.22
COLBY, PEGGY	\$63.00
COLUMBIA FALLS, CITY OF	\$24.41
COLUMBIA PAINT & COATINGS	\$43.68
COMMERCIAL MACHINE SERVICES, INC	\$682.00
COMSTOR INFORMATION MANAGEMENT, INC	\$36.43
CONRAD MAIN STREET LLC	\$3,388.66
CONRAD, CHARLES	\$20.34
CONSOLIDATED ELECTRICAL DIST, INC	\$8.37
COOK, GARY	\$52.25
CORRIGAN, EDWARD	\$28.00
CRAWFORD SUPPLY CO	\$49.44
CRESCENT ELECTRIC SUPPLY CO	\$192.92
CRIMINAL RECORDS	\$236.25
CRITELLI COURIERS	\$974.00
CROWN AWARDS	\$126.75
CRUCELL VACCINES INC	\$680.00
CULLIGAN WATER	\$1,119.25
CUNDY, JUDIE	\$175.00
CUNNINGHAM, CHRISTOPHER	\$41.00
CURRIER'S WELDING INC	\$230.00
D&L VENTURES INC	\$16,198.29
DAHLEM, MICHAEL ATTORNEY AT LAW	\$475.00
DAILY INTERLAKE	\$5,202.80
DAPHNE SOFTWARE INC	\$1,341.67
DATA IMAGING SYSTEMS INC	\$679.46
DAVEY, AMANDA	\$100.00
DEMCO, INC	\$1,517.33
DEPRATU FORD SALES	\$1,920.67
DEPT OF ADMINISTRATION 2	\$1,671.27
DEPT OF JUSTICE 6	\$8,856.40
DEPT OF REVENUE 6	\$332.81
DEPT OF TRANSPORTATION 3	\$2,000.00
DESCH JENNIFER	\$40.00
DIERENFIELD, DUANE	\$20.48
DIGITAL COMMUNICATIONS SYSTEM, INC	\$2,354.48
DONOVAN, JOHN	\$69.00
DOUBLE A VINEYARDS & DOUBLE A WILLOW	\$446.96
DOUBLE DEUCE TOWING	\$408.00
DPHHS/LAB	\$1,759.50
DUGAN, TERI	\$35.00
DYON, MICHAEL R	\$27.77
EASON, HOLLY	\$35.00
ECLINICAL WORKS	\$4,178.75
ECOM FOLDERS	\$124.95
ED JONES COMPANY, INC	\$175.00
EHRICK, CASEY	\$15.00

**May, 2013**  
**(Continued)**

EISINGER MOTORS	\$27,465.13
ELDER, JERRY	\$230.55
ELECTION CENTER	\$700.00
ELECTRICAL SYSTEMS INC	\$3,124.10
ELLIS, FREDRICK CLINTON	\$750.00
EMERGENCY PREPAREDNESS SERVICE LLC	\$93.00
ENCOMPASS SUPPLY	\$44.23
ENERGY LABORATORIES INC	\$732.00
ENVIRO-TIRE INC	\$1,969.50
ERGOMETRICS & APPLIED PERSONNEL RESEARCH	\$368.60
ERIC HUMMEL, ATTORNEY AT LAW	\$308.00
ESTEP CAPITAL MANAGEMENT	\$1,466.06
EVERGREEN DISPOSAL INC	\$20,431.38
EVERGREEN VOLUNTEER FIRE DEPARTMENT	\$762.80
EVERGREEN WATER DISTRICT #1	\$17.48
EXPRESS SERVICES INC	\$13,448.44
FAIRFAX, JEANNIE	\$15.75
FARMER BROTHERS CO	\$240.10
FASTENAL COMPANY	\$209.45
FASTENERS INC	\$271.32
FASTOYS LLC	\$557.67
FCM LEASING	\$688.00
FEDEX EXPRESS	\$65.26
FERGUSON ENTERPRISES, INC	\$199.90
FERRON'S TOWING, INC	\$448.50
FINSEL, RISHARA	\$23.00
FIRE SYSTEMS WEST INC	\$305.00
FIRST INTERSTATE BANK WHITEFISH	\$6.00
FISH, DELORES	\$500.00
FISHER, BRETT	\$80.00
FISTER, TYLER	\$48.03
FLATHEAD BEACON	\$264.00
FLATHEAD CITY-COUNTY HEALTH DEPT	\$345.00
FLATHEAD CO SEARCH & RESCUE	\$745.80
FLATHEAD CO TREASURER	\$27.08
FLATHEAD COMMUNITY FOUNDATION	\$2,000.00
FLATHEAD CONCRETE PRODUCTS INC	\$4,270.00
FLATHEAD ELECTRIC COOPERATIVE INC	\$27,233.74
FLATHEAD INDUSTRIES	\$1,014.41
FLATHEAD PET EMERGENCY	\$231.82
FLATHEAD VALLEY COMMUNITY COLLEGE	\$3,450.00
FLATHEAD VALLEY UMPIRE'S ASSN	\$1,932.00
FLEET INDUSTRIES	\$381.39
FLINK, PAMELA	\$53.08
FLO-RITE PLUMBING INC	\$175.00
FOOD SERVICES OF AMERICA	\$8,187.56
FORT HARRISON B.O.Q.	\$252.00
FREEMAN, EMILY	\$30.00
FUSION COMMUNICATIONS & CONSULTING	\$317.38
GALLES FILTER SERVICE, INC.	\$41.87
GALLS INC	\$307.93
GARCIA, OSCAR	\$120.00
GCR TIRE CENTER	\$538.70
GEFFS MANUFACTURING, INC	\$1,102.32
GENE LARD REAL ESTATE APPRAISALS	\$1,500.00
GLACIER FORKLIFT & EQUIPMENT, INC	\$593.00
GLACIER GLASS INC	\$721.00
GLACIER LOG MILL	\$3,848.00
GLACIER WHOLESALERS INC	\$835.06
GLAXOSMITHKLINE PHARMACEUTICALS	\$2,316.00
GLIDDEN, MEGAN	\$35.00
GLOBALSTAR USA LLC	\$89.88
GO-4-U FREIGHT SERVICE	\$59.00
GOODMAN REPORTING	\$64.50
GOPHER SPORT	\$315.55
GRADE 8 EARTHWORKS	\$2,025.00
GRANT, NELSON	\$69.00
GREASE MONKEY	\$510.83
GREAT BEAR BUILDERS INC	\$1,295.00
GREAT NORTHERN PBE	\$816.25
GREEN, JESSE	\$58.00
GRIBBELLE, PATIENCE	\$179.00
GRIME FIGHTERS OF FLATHEAD VALLEY	\$595.00
GRIZZLY MOON MASH, LLC	\$98.10
GRIZZLY SECURITY ALARMS INC	\$225.00



**May, 2013**  
**(Continued)**

GSS ELECTRIC INC	\$636.20
GUZMAN, DANIELLE	\$60.00
H&H EXPRESS INC	\$61.10
HALDEN, DALTON	\$40.00
HALL, TRAVIS	\$54.00
HAMILTON, TAMARA	\$41.00
HAMMER, HEWITT, JACOBS & QUINN PLLC	\$614.52
HAROLD ELECTRIC CO	\$392.86
HARREL, ANDREW S	\$190.00
HARRISON, AARON	\$69.00
HARTSOCH, DOROTHY	\$750.00
HARTSOCH, FAYE	\$14.40
HAUSS ACCOUNTS INC	\$3,724.24
HENRY SCHEIN	\$5,473.10
HESKA CORPORATION	\$425.75
HIGH COUNTRY LINEN SUPPLY	\$1,731.78
HIGH PLAINS PIZZA INC	\$112.99
HIGHLINE COMMUNICATIONS	\$3,179.74
HILL'S PET NUTRITION SALES INC	\$28.17
HINTZ, JENNIFER L	\$74.86
HINZMAN, DUSTIN	\$70.06
HOLAND, SALLY	\$27.00
HOLIDAY INN MISSOULA PARKSIDE	\$1,950.42
HOME DEPOT CREDIT SERVICES	\$2,182.77
HOON, MICK	\$37.43
HOUGHTON MIFFLIN COMPANY CORP	\$698.62
HOUSE OF CLEAN	\$887.07
HUNGRY HORSE WATER & SEWER DIST	\$107.63
I-STATE TRUCK CENTER	\$441.85
IBS INCORPORATED	\$1,185.60
IDAHO TRANSPORTATION DEPT	\$21.00
IDENTISYS	\$518.50
INDECOMM GLOBAL SERVICE	\$14.00
INGRAM LIBRARY SERVICES	\$13,863.27
INLAND TRUCK PARTS & SERVICE	\$258.71
INSTAMED	\$225.00
INSTY PRINTS	\$4,072.07
INSURED TITLES	\$4,600.00
INTEGRATED SECURITY SOLUTIONS INC	\$1,364.75
INTERSTATE ALARM CO	\$106.00
IPROMOTEU.COM	\$514.42
ISLES JR, JOHN	\$68.00
J2 OFFICE PRODUCTS	\$13,916.75
JACK'S TRUCK & EQUIPMENT	\$2,368.00
JAKO AUTO GLASS, LLC	\$685.00
JAMIESON, BRUCE	\$500.00
JANITORS WORLD SUPPLIES	\$2,230.81
JKG ENTERPRISES	\$382.00
JOHN JUMP TRUCKING INC	\$20,886.50
JOHNSON CONTROLS INC	\$8,680.50
JOHNSON, BRIAN	\$63.85
JOHNSON, CAMELLIA A	\$91.24
JOHNSON, CASH ANDERS	\$140.00
JOHNSON, REBECCA	\$35.00
JOHNSON, ROBERTS & ASSOCIATES	\$16.50
JOHNSON-GLOSCHAT FUNERAL HOME	\$2,600.00
JOHNSTONE SUPPLY	\$656.60
JONES, LAUREN	\$238.85
JP COOKE CO	\$379.02
K&J AUTO PARTS INC	\$359.85
K&J INVESTMENTS LLC	\$41,101.71
KAJ-TV	\$870.00
KALISPELL ALIGNMENT & AUTO REPAIR INC	\$697.73
KALISPELL AUTO PARTS	\$7,022.54
KALISPELL CITY	\$92.00
KALISPELL CITY WATER DEPT	\$1,114.74
KALISPELL COPY & BLUE INC	\$317.26
KALISPELL DOWNTOWN ASSOCIATION	\$50.00
KALISPELL ELECTRIC INC	\$988.40
KALISPELL ESTATE PLANNING INC	\$7.00
KALISPELL OVERHEAD DOOR SERVICE INC	\$2,635.60
KALISPELL PARKING COMMISSION	\$80.00
KALISPELL REGIONAL MEDICAL CENTER	\$26,635.00
KALISPELL SENIOR CENTER	\$685.00
KALLIS, KATHI	\$36.00

**May, 2013**  
**(Continued)**

KAMAN INDUSTRIAL TECHNOLOGIES CORP	\$306.66
KARL, LEIGHA	\$3,000.00
KEEFE COMMISSARY NETWORK SALES	\$437.50
KEFAUVER, KEVIN	\$500.00
KELLY, BRIAN	\$210.00
KENWORTH SALES MISSOULA	\$83.35
KIVELA, TOMMY	\$29.00
KLS HYDRAULICS & MACHINE WORKS LLC	\$8,873.80
KMART 7030	\$103.40
KOFI INC	\$612.00
KOHL, PAMELA	\$14.40
KRUCKENBERG, LISA M	\$320.00
KUGLER, SHAWNA	\$12.00
KUNTZ, DEVIN	\$24.00
KUSLER, SHELBI KRISTEN	\$32.50
LAKESIDE COMMUNITY CHAPEL	\$300.00
LAKESIDE COUNTY WATER & SEWER	\$46.75
LAMAR COMPANIES THE	\$1,745.00
LAROQUE, KRISTA	\$41.00
LARSEN, ERIKA	\$97.18
LASALLE AUTOMOTIVE	\$260.60
LASALLE EQUINE CLINIC, PLLC	\$3,913.15
LASALLE SAND & GRAVEL	\$1,953.49
LAW OFFICE OF JOAN COOK	\$7.00
LAWSON PRODUCTS	\$4,355.78
LBMT LLC	\$22,249.52
LC STAFFING SERVICE	\$16,810.60
LEACH, DORIS	\$500.00
LEADERSHIP FLATHEAD	\$900.00
LEADSONLINE LLC	\$2,238.00
LEAF	\$93.00
LEBERMAN, ANNIE	\$52.25
LEGER, DAVID	\$25.00
LELANDS'S HONDA-SUZUKI-BMW	\$24.94
LENOIR, RODNEY	\$26.40
LES SCHWAB TIRE CENTER	\$284.41
LES SCHWAB TIRE CENTER #904	\$468.72
LIBERTY NORTHWEST	\$797.57
LILIENTHAL INSULATION COMPANY LLC	\$1,500.00
LINCOLN ELECTRIC COOPERATIVE INC	\$10,420.00
LINDAHL, BRUCE W & JUDY L	\$20.00
LISS, HANNAH NICOLE	\$37.50
LIST, KATHERINE A	\$1,500.00
LOCKEY INC	\$195.35
LODIEN, PHILIP	\$20.00
LOREN'S CARPET CARE	\$400.00
LOVE-PATTEN, TRACY	\$36.30
LOVEALL, W E	\$44.78
LOWER VALLEY VETERINARY CLINIC PC	\$75.00
LUND, JEANNINE M	\$41.00
LUPO, MICHAEL J	\$500.00
LYNN, JAMIE E	\$13.50
MACDC	\$600.00
MACIJUNAS, GREGORY	\$25.00
MACO/JPIA	\$2,505.34
MADISON, BECKY	\$500.00
MAGIP	\$30.00
MAHUGH FIRE & SAFETY, LLC	\$1,957.45
MAIL ROOM, THE	\$12,657.74
MAKULEC, JENNIFER	\$2,775.00
MANGOLD, MELISSA	\$100.00
MAROTZ, JULIE	\$12.00
MARSH, SUNDRA	\$500.00
MARTY'S CAR AUDIO	\$80.00
MATTER, MARGRIT	\$10.00
MATTHEWS, WILLIAM V	\$46.05
MAY, KAITLYN	\$140.00
MCMILLAN, MICHALLE	\$304.54
MDM SUPPLY COMPANY	\$318.22
MEDICAL ARTS PRESS	\$114.59
MERCK SHARP & DOHME CORP	\$3,840.52
MEREDITH CONSTRUCTION CO	\$5,005.14
METAL WORKS & MUFFLER	\$185.00
MEYMAX TITLE AGENCY OF OHIO	\$21.00
MIDWAY RENTAL & POWER EQUIPMENT INC	\$32.73

**May, 2013**  
**(Continued)**

MIDWEST TAPE LLC	\$6,547.49
MILD FENCE COMPANY	\$7,948.77
MILLER, ATHENA	\$205.00
MILLER, MARY-ANNE	\$99.87
MISSOULA CO DETENTION FACILITY	\$1,125.00
MJC&MCCA	\$245.00
MONTANA ACE - KALISPELL	\$250.89
MONTANA DEPT ENVIROMENTAL QUALITY	\$30.00
MONTANA DIETARY MANAGERS ASSN	\$50.00
MONTANA ENVIRONMENTAL LAB LLC	\$42.00
MONTANA INTERACTIVE	\$15.00
MONTANA LAND PROJECT, LLC	\$19,869.57
MONTANA MEDICAID	\$66.17
MONTANA MEDICAL BILLING	\$467.76
MONTANA ONE CALL CENTER	\$309.62
MONTANA PETERBILT	\$626.76
MONTANA RIVER GUIDES	\$6,195.00
MONTANA SKY NETWORKS, INC	\$267.28
MONTANA STATE EXTENSION	\$10,911.68
MONTANO, FELICIA	\$80.00
MORRELL, JIM	\$15.00
MORRISON & FRAMPTON	\$8.00
MORRISON, ERIC	\$69.00
MOTOROLA	\$667,733.30
MOUNTAIN VIEW PET CREMATORY INC	\$120.00
MOUNTAIN VISTA HOA	\$5.00
MOUNTRAIL COUNTY SHERIFF'S DEPARTMENT	\$25.00
MSU EXTENSION PUBLICATIONS	\$107.90
MURDOCH'S RANCH & HOME SUPPLY, INC	\$2,211.32
MURPHY, THOMAS L	\$16.52
MWI VETERINARY SUPPLY	\$779.19
NAETHE, TERI	\$12.00
NASO, CAROLYN	\$68.00
NATIONAL DISTRICT ATTORNEYS ASSN	\$595.00
NATIONWIDE TITLE	\$14.00
NEW WORLD SYSTEMS	\$13,575.00
NEWMAN, MICHAEL M. MD PC	\$350.00
NOMAD TECHNOLOGIES INC	\$286.00
NORCO, INC	\$1,244.72
NORMONT EQUIPMENT CO	\$546.30
NORTH AMERICAN BUS INDUSTRIES INC	\$124.60
NORTH VALLEY REFUSE	\$60.00
NORTH VALLEY SENIOR CENTER	\$710.00
NORTHERN TOOL & EQUIPMENT CATALOG	\$401.63
NORTHLAND HOBBIES	\$19.00
NORTHWEST FUEL SYSTEMS	\$345.54
NORTHWEST PARTS & EQUIPMENT	\$1,499.33
NORTHWEST PIPE FITTINGS INC	\$177.91
NORTHWEST PORTABLES LLC	\$980.00
NORTHWEST TRUCK REPAIR INC	\$17,130.20
NORTHWESTERN ENERGY 1	\$12,945.69
NOVKO KALISPELL	\$1,082.36
NURTURING CENTER INC	\$1,509.99
NW INK & TONER	\$410.00
OAKINS, ANGELA	\$41.00
OHS BODY SHOP	\$220.00
OLSEN, ROUTH CRABTREE P.S.	\$5.00
OLSON, WENDY	\$92.50
ONE-STOP BUSINESS LICENSING	\$801.00
OPTIMUM	\$299.60
OSHWALLA LLC	\$2,875.35
OTTEN, MARCY	\$59.50
PACIFIC STEEL & RECYCLING	\$357.75
PARADIGM MANAGEMENT PC	\$123,945.69
PARAGON BERMUDA (CANADA) LTD	\$651.00
PARPOVICH, JAMES L	\$500.00
PATHWAYS HEALTHCARE	\$4,551.83
PAULSON, JOAN	\$17.00
PAUTSCH, MARK	\$46.60
PAYNEWEST INSURANCE INC	\$118.00
PEASLEY, DEAN R	\$3,920.99
PEEWEEES PORTA-POTTIES	\$75.00
PENCO POWER PRODUCTS	\$693.58
PENWORTHY COMPANY, THE	\$701.65
PERFORMANCE HEATING & AIR LLC	\$600.00

**May, 2013**  
**(Continued)**

PETHEALTH SERVICES INC	\$1,929.25
PETTYJOHN'S THE WATER STORE INC	\$36.00
PHILADELPHIA INSURANCE COMPANIES	\$300.00
PHILLIPS, DIANE M	\$99.44
PHILLIPS, JEAN M	\$19.80
PHOTO VIDEO PLUS	\$9.54
PIERCE COUNTY SHERIFF'S DEPT	\$125.00
PIERCE MFG. COMPANY INC	\$152.80
PILSCH, COREY	\$34.00
PINNACLE INVESTIGATION CORP	\$553.00
PORTER, CAROLYN	\$30.00
POWDER COATING OF KALISPELL	\$480.00
PRIER, LOGAN	\$300.00
PROFORCE MARKETING INC	\$1,304.95
R&S NORTHEAST, LLC	\$2,976.22
RADIO SHACK ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE	\$26.99
RAK CONSTRUCTION	\$2,777.00
RANGER STORAGE	\$2,650.00
READY FREDDY INC	\$800.00
RED EAGLE AVIATION, INC	\$288.26
REPLAY SPORTS	\$760.11
RICHARDS, DORA	\$500.00
RICOH USA INC	\$654.44
RIDGELINE COMMUNICATIONS	\$1,463.71
RIEBE'S MACHINE WORKS INC	\$565.00
RIMROCK STAGES INC	\$68.95
RN & DB LLC	\$13,456.93
ROBERT PECCIA & ASSOCIATES INC	\$5,896.88
ROCKY MOUNTAIN IMAGES INC	\$886.50
RODDA PAINT CO	\$1,050.10
ROLL, ARLEN	\$18.84
RON'S ALIGNMENT INC	\$210.00
ROSAUERS 1	\$214.36
ROSE COMMUNICATION	\$100.00
ROUTEMATCH SOFTWARE INC	\$25,337.27
SALAMANDER TECHNOLOGIES INC	\$16,411.75
SAM'S HOSPITALITY & CATERING CONSULTING	\$105.00
SANDON CONSTRUCTION CO INC	\$825.00
SANOFI PASTEUR, INC	\$1,356.73
SAUERBIER, MARY	\$500.00
SCHAEFER PSYCHIATRIC SERVICES	\$2,700.00
SCHINDLER ELEVATOR CORPORATION	\$2,085.00
SCHMIDT, CATHERINE	\$84.45
SECRETARY OF STATE	\$50.00
SELBYS	\$320.00
SHAFFNER'S BINDERY	\$34.10
SHEPPARD, LISA	\$36.00
SHERWIN WILLIAMS	\$643.80
SHOWELL, JEFFREY	\$220.07
SIMAC, TERESA	\$30.78
SIMPSON, MARGIE	\$90.00
SIX ROBBLEES' INC	\$283.66
SLAMA, JELENA	\$42.00
SLITERS ACE	\$117.45
SLITERS ACE 1	\$78.52
SMITH MEDICAL PARTNERS LLC	\$2,569.60
SMITH, ABAGAIL JEAN	\$70.00
SMITH, SARAH C	\$350.00
SMITHS CUSTOMER SERVICE	\$32.21
SNAP-ON DIVISION	\$166.41
SOBCZAK, CARLTON G	\$34.60
SOLID WASTE SYSTEMS INC	\$710.19
SPECIAL FRIENDS ADVOCACY PROGRAM	\$1,949.94
SPICHER, DANIEL RODNEY	\$48.30
SPIRIT DOCUMENT SERVICES	\$20.00
SPOKANE HOUSE OF HOSE, INC	\$903.29
ST MARIE GRAPHICS	\$1,069.37
STANFORD POLICE & EMERGENCY SUPPLY	\$19.90
STAPLES CREDIT PLAN	\$561.13
STATE PUBLIC DEFENDER	\$100.00
STEFANATZ, JOHN	\$16.80
STERICYCLE INC	\$277.77
STERRY, LAUREL JO	\$47.60
STOCKMAN BANK	\$7.00
STOLL, RYAN	\$123.59

**May, 2013**  
**(Continued)**

STRAND, EARL H	\$500.00
STURGIS, LOIS M	\$500.00
SULLIVAN, DEBRA K	\$107.92
SULLIVAN, MARK R	\$36.00
SUPER 1 FOODS	\$48.60
SUPER 1 FOODS 1	\$68.78
SWEET PEAKS ICE CREAM INC	\$750.00
SWISS CHALET EXCAVATING	\$9,435.00
SWT ENGINEERING, INC	\$19,155.68
SYKES PHARMACY INC	\$1,259.40
SYSCO FOOD SERVICES OF MONTANA INC	\$5,087.91
SZUCH, APRIL	\$68.00
T-BEND CONSTRUCTION INC.	\$4,331.25
TARTAGLINO, EUGENIA	\$41.00
TENNANT SALES & SERVICE COMPANY	\$420.66
TENNANT, STEVEN	\$41.95
TERRY'S SMALL ENGINE & REPAIR	\$186.25
TESSCO INCORPORATED	\$1,514.40
TEST INC	\$17,210.00
TEVA PHARMACEUTICALS USA INC	\$669.60
THERACOM, INC	\$631.26
THOMSON WEST	\$273.50
THREE RIVERS BANK	\$3,359.63
TIRE RAMA SOUTH	\$10,565.45
TITAN MACHINERY	\$1,169.39
TITLE FINANCIAL SPECIALTY SERVICES	\$14.00
TONERPORT INCORPORATED	\$1,527.95
TOP TO BOTTOM	\$73.61
TOTAL SCREEN DESIGN & EMBROIDERY	\$271.30
TOW MASTER INC	\$185.00
TOWN PUMP KALISPELL #1	\$43.28
TOWNE MAILER INC	\$750.42
TRI-STATE TRUCK & EQUIPMENT INC	\$105.92
TRIMBLE NAVIGATION LTD	\$1,820.95
TRINASTICH, RICHARD B	\$150.00
TRIPLE W EQUIPMENT INC	\$2,053.57
TRIPPET'S PRINTING	\$2,130.00
TRUENORTH STEEL	\$1,962.12
TURNER, PATRICIA L	\$37.56
TYLER TECHNOLOGIES INC	\$357.72
ULINE	\$103.31
UNIQUE MANAGEMENT SERVICES INC	\$313.25
UNITED WAY OF FLATHEAD COUNTY	\$20.00
UNIVERSAL ATHLETIC SERVICE INC	\$346.92
URBAN, PAT	\$63.00
VALLEY FORD	\$510.20
VALLEY LINEN	\$171.76
VALVOLINE EXPRESS CARE	\$114.96
VAN WELL NURSERY	\$306.37
VAUDT, KAILEA	\$175.00
VERIZON WIRELESS 4	\$7,224.39
VONDAL, DAYLE R	\$21.00
WALLACE WILDLIFE SERVICES, LLC	\$900.00
WALLACE, BRIANA	\$41.00
WARDEN PAPER	\$1,188.75
WARNE CHEMICAL & EQUIPMENT CO	\$139.40
WARTNOW, BILLIE	\$500.00
WEATHERS, THOMAS C & LEANN	\$3,195.62
WEBER, ZACHARY JAY	\$5,250.00
WELLS FARGO BANK IDAHO	\$11.00
WERK, KAITLYN	\$252.50
WEST PAYMENT CENTER	\$140.06
WESTCOAST PAPER	\$423.75
WESTERN BUILDING CENTER 2	\$177.75
WESTERN BUILDING CENTER 3	\$3,366.95
WESTERN DETENTION PRODUCTS INC	\$3,096.97
WESTERN ELECTRONICS, INC	\$995.00
WESTERN MT MENTAL HEALTH CENTER	\$500.00
WESTERN STATES EQUIPMENT COMPANY	\$33,185.06
WESTERN STATES TRUCK COMPANY	\$205.17
WESTLAND SEED INC	\$1,995.00
WHALEN TIRE	\$1,820.00
WHITE, JODY BETH	\$29.00
WHITE, TANIKA	\$61.98
WHITEFISH AUTO PARTS INC	\$2,851.59

**May, 2013  
(Continued)**

WHITEFISH GOLDEN AGERS INC	\$760.00
WHITEMAN, ANDY	\$40.00
WILDER, DR WALLACE S	\$50.00
WINDAUER, JUDY K	\$37.99
WINGO, DIANA	\$11.87
WMW ENGINEERING PC	\$14,000.00
WOEPPEL, DARIN	\$58.00
WRIGHT, KATHY	\$64.12
WYGANT, AMANDA ELAINE	\$13.13
XEROX CORPORATION 1	\$615.32
XL DENT	\$80.00
YACHECHAK, KACI	\$43.20
YACHT, JEANE	\$500.00
YATCHAK, JANET A	\$198.12
YORK, LYNN 1	\$30.00

Grand Total: \$2,152,485.97

Claims for the month of May, 2013 approved this 5<sup>th</sup> day of June, 2013.

**BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS  
Flathead County, Montana**

**By/s/Pamela J. Holmquist  
Pamela J. Holmquist, Chairman**

**By/s/Paula Robinson  
Paula Robinson, Clerk**

**PUBLIC NOTICE**

**The Board of County Commissioners of Flathead County did this 5<sup>th</sup> day of June, 2013, approve payroll and claims for payment in the amount of \$4,508,053.33 for the period beginning May 1, 2013, and ending on May 31, 2013.**

**The full and complete claim list is available for public view in the Office of the Clerk & Recorder, Flathead County Courthouse, Kalispell, Montana. Individual requests for personal copies will be accepted by the Clerk and Recorder.**

**Dated this 5<sup>th</sup> day of June, 2013.**

**BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS  
Flathead County, Montana**

**By /s/Pamela J. Holmquist  
Pamela J. Holmquist, Chairman**

**By /s/Paula Robinson  
Paula Robinson, Clerk**

**Publish June 15, 2013.**

**PUBLIC NOTICE**

**The Board of County Commissioners' proceedings for Flathead County for the period of May 1, 2013 thru May 31, 2013, are now available for public review in the Office of the Clerk and Recorder, Flathead County Courthouse, Kalispell, Montana.**

**Individual requests for personal copies will be accepted by the Flathead County Clerk and Recorder, Flathead County, Courthouse, Kalispell, Montana.**

**Dated this 5<sup>th</sup> day of June, 2013.**

**BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS  
Flathead County, Montana**

**By /s/Pamela J. Holmquist  
Pamela J. Holmquist, Chairman**

**By /s/Paula Robinson  
Paula Robinson, Clerk**

**Publish June 15, 2013.**

\*\*\*\*\*